Item #2:
Resolution Awarding 2011/12 Road Paving Program

07/18/11




VILLAGE OF LONG GROVE
RESOLUTION NO. 2011-R-__

RESOLUTION AWARDING A CONTRACT FOR VILLAGE ROAD PAVING

WHEREAS, bids for the FY 2011/12 Village Road Paving Contract were received on July 14,
2011; and

WHEREAS, the Village has reviewed the proposals received and determined that the proposal
of Schroeder Asphalt Services, Inc. was the most favorable to the interests of the Village;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE PRESIDENT AND BOARD OF TRUSTEES
OF THE VILLAGE OF LONG GROVE, LAKE COUNTY, ILLINOIS, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1: Recitals. The foregoing recitals are hereby incorporated herein as findings of the

Village Board of Trustees.

Section 2: Award. The Village of Long Grove hereby awards the FY 2011/12 Village Road
Paving Contract to Schroeder Asphalt Services, Inc., in the base bid and bid option #1 in the amount
of $214,036.29 and $29,427.50 respectively totaling $243,463.79, subject to IDOT Confirmation at the
end of the eight (8) day waiting period (July 26, 2011) of prequalification and conditioned upon the
receipt of all contractually required documentation and such other additional information that may be
requested by the Village Manager in accordance with the Coniract that is acceptable to the Village of
Long Grove.

Section 3: Effective Date. This Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and after its

passage and approval in the manner provided by law.
PASSED this 26" day of July, 2011.
AYES: () Trustees: XXXX,XXXX
NAYS: () XXXX
ABSENT: ()} XXXX

APPROVED this 26™ day of July, 2011.

Village President, Maria Rodriguez

ATTEST:

Village Clerk, Karen Schultheis






ESI CONSULTANTS,LTD

Excellence, Service, Integrity
NAPERVILLE+ CHARLESTON
CHICAGO «STOCKTON

July 18, 2011

David Lothspeich

Village Manager

Village of Long Grove
3110 RFD

Long Grove, lllincis 60047

Re: PROJECT AWARD RECOMMENDATION - Long Grove 2011 Street Program
Section No.: 11-00000-01-GM
ESI Project No.: 04-026-018-01 BG# 224

Dear Mr. Lothspeich:

ES| Consultants, Ltd. (ESI) is pleased to notify the Village of Long Grove that ten (10) different
contractors have obtained bid documents for the 2011 Sireet Program. At the bid opening on July 14,
2011, 2:05 pm, at the Village Hall, six (6) bids were submitted and reviewed. The apparent low bidder for
the BASE BID and BID OPTION 1 was Schroeder Asphalt Services, Inc. with a BASE BID of
$214,036.29 and a BID OPTION 1 bid of $29,427.50. ES| would like to note that the BASE BID came in
nearly $50,338.96 under the engineer's estimated amount and the BID OPTION 1 bid came in $3,492.50
under the engineer's estimated amount. The average bhid amount for the BASE BID and BID OPTION 1
are approximately $233,288.51 and $34,464.00, respectively. Based on the average bid amounts, the
BASE BID came in approximately $31,086.74 under the engineer's estimated amount. The average BID
OPTION 1 amount came in approximately $1,094.00 over the engineer's estimated amount. Attached to
this letter is a complete summary of bids. In addition, also aitached to this letter is a detailed summary of
all bids tabulated on the lllingis Department of Transportation {IDOT) Bureau of Local Reads (BLR 12315}
forms for the BASE BID and BID CPTION 1.

ESI finds that the unit prices to be within acceptable ranges based on our review and comparison to other
bids received. After reviewing and comparing the other comparable bids received fo the lowest bidder, it
appears that the unit pricing for Traffic Control and Protection for the BASE BID was approximately 54%-
208% higher. When comparing the lowest bidder unit prices o the engineer's estimated unit prices, the
engineer's unit pricing for hot-mix asphalt line items and pavement marking line items were higher. This
is in part due to the volatility of cil prices over the last two months, When the original engineer's estimate
of costs was developed, the oil prices were approximately 15%-25% higher. This directly correlates to
the hot-mix asphalt costs. The unit pricing for epoxy pavement marking in 2010 was more than four fimes
the cost received for 2011 and the unit pricing for thermoplastic pavement marking in 2010 was more
than twice the cost received for 2011.

As recommended by IDOT, a minimum of eight (8) days shall be waited before officially awarding
the project in order to allow time to elapse for any bid challenges or protests. Subject to IDOT
confirmation at the end of the eight (8) day waiting period (July 26, 2011), it is our
recommendation that Schroeder Asphalt Services, Inc. be conditionally awarded the BASE BID
and BID OPTION 1 contract for the Long Grove 2011 Street Program in the amount of $214,036.28,
and $29,427.50, respectively. Once IDOT confirmation is received and the eight (8) day waiting

1979 N. Mill Street, Suite 100, Naperville, lilinois 60563 « phone 630.420.1700 « fax 630.420.1733 « www.esiconsultantsltd.com



period has elapsed, it is recommended that the Village execute the BASE BID and BID OPTION 1
Contract such that work can begin as soon as possible.

Please call me if you have any additional questions.

Sincerely,
ESI Consulting, Ltd.

Brandt T. Zentner, . DECI, CPESC, CPIl
Project Engineer/Resident Engineer

Attachment

C: Joseph Chiczewski, PE — ES/ Consultants, Ltd.
Brian Witkowski, PE — ES/ Consultants, Lid,

ESI

www.esiconsultantslid.com



VILLAGE OF
LONG GROVE

3110 RFD Long Grove, lllinois 60047—9635
Phone (847) 634-~9440 )
Fox {847) 634—9408

PROJECT: LONG GROVE 2011 STREET PROGRAM

BIiD OPENING DATE: July 14, 2011

TIME: 2:05 PM
2011 STREET PROGRAM
SUMMARY OF BIDS
CONTRACTOR CONTRACTOR BID AMOUNT
BASE BID BID OPTION 1

ENGINEERS ESTIMATE OF FROBABLE COST $ 264375251 % 33,370.00
Arrow Road Construction NO BID NO BID
Maneval Construction Co. NO BIiD NO BID
Brother's Asphalt Paving, Inc. NO BID NO BID
JA Johnson Paving $248,414.17 $38,885.00
Peter Baker & Sons Co. $220,467.97 $32,231.50
Chicagoland Paving Contractors, Inc. $219,564.35 $29,900.00
Greg Greenhill Construction Co. $275,553.15 $43,240.00
Geske and Sons, Inc. NO BID NQ BID
Curran Contracting Company $221,685.10 $33,100.00

BASE BID
LOW BIDDER AMOUNT
Schoeder Asphalt Services, Inc. $214,036.29
BID OPTION 1
LOW BIDDER AMOUNT
Schoeder Asphalt Services, Inc. $29,427.50
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